
 

 

 

Post-Doc position with a focus on behavioral economics/behavioral deci-
sion theory 

 

Grenoble Ecole de Management (GEM) in Grenoble, France 
(http://en.grenoble-em.com/) is seeking a full-time post doctorate level re-
searcher for a European Union research project on the effects of individual time 
and risk preferences on the adoption of energy efficiency measures in house-
holds.  

The ideal candidate has a PhD in economics, psychology or marketing, with a 
strong conceptual background in behavioral economics/behavioral decision 
theory. Expertise in survey design/implementation and in micro-econometric 
methods would be a plus. Candidates who have shown the ability to combine 
theory with empirical work are especially encouraged to apply. Applicants must 
be highly proficient in English and have excellent professional writing skills. The 
position starts in March 2015 and may run up to 2.5 years. Compensation is 
based on skills and experience. The position offers an international academic 
environment and ample opportunities for network-building. 

Grenoble Ecole de Management is a fast growing business school located at 
the foot of the French Alps in a vibrant and growing metropolitan area with a 

strong emphasis on high‐tech industries (especially nanotechnologies, microe-
lectronics, and energy). The School benefits from this community and has es-
tablished a strong reputation in the management of technology and innovation. 
Grenoble Ecole de Management has the triple accreditation AACSB, EQUIS, 
and AMBA. Degrees awarded include Bachelor, Masters, MBA, DBA, and PhD. 
Grenoble Ecole de Management is regularly ranked among the top 20 business 
schools in Europe. 

Interested applicants should submit a letter of interest highlighting their relevant 
background and experience, a detailed CV, copies of university diplomas, two 
academic references, and a copy of their PhD thesis and/or academic papers 
by email to joachim.schleich@grenoble-em.com or corinne.faure@grenoble-
em.com using the following text in the subject line: “PostDoc application - [Your 
Name]”. 

Review of applications will start on 26 January 2015. The position will remain 
open until filled.  
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